
 COUNTY OF LEAVENWORTH
2021 ROAD OIL BID OPENING

BID TABULATION - FINAL

Item Description

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
Overland Park, KS

Vance Brothers
Kansas City, MO

Pick up price per
gal.

Delivered price
per gal.

Pick up price per
gal.

Delivered
price per gal.

MC-250 no bid no bid $2.25 $2.33
MC-800 no bid no bid $2.15 $2.23
MC-3000 no bid no bid $2.15 $2.23
SS-1H $1.77 $1.95 $1.90 $1.98
CRS1H $1.63 $1.81 $1.95 $2.03
Demurrage $88.00/hr $70.00/hr
Return service charge full freight/half freight no charge
Leavenworth County Contractor (local preference, percentage difference from lowest bid)


	Worksheets
	Construction Estimate


